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International Public Notice:​
"De-Dollarization" Was Planned in 1910 

 

Both "De-Dollarization" and "De-Banking" were planned in 1910, as a series of secret 
meetings by international bankers held at Jekyll Island, Georgia, and subsequent 
meetings held at diverse locations leading up to the adoption of the Federal Reserve Act 
on Christmas Eve 1913. 

To pretend that this present circumstance wasn't planned FAR in advance and carried 
through, observably, year after year and decade after decade ---is the ultimate 
prevarication.   

The Federal Reserve is the Plan and has been the Plan for over a hundred years.  
Blaming the Federal Reserve for being the Plan is like blaming a fictional character for 
taking a wrong turn in a book that you are writing.  

Clearly, the problem isn't Jerome Powell.  He is carrying out his known obligation to his 
shareholders and that hasn't changed in over a hundred years, so, you might as well 
arrest all the Federal Reserve Board Chairmen and all the members of the House 
Banking and Oversight Subcommittees and all the various Board Members of  Federal 
Reserve Banks for the past 112 years. Throw away the key. 

The Plan was simple.  Grab all the gold possible and gain control of the gold market so 
that central banks could control the price of gold with one hand, and by controlling the 
supply, control the value, and monopolize access to the gold.  This then also controls 
credit based on the gold assets.   

This artificial manipulation of commodities, known as "commodity rigging" --- which 
inevitably results in obstruction of trade --- is the known goal of central banks and the 
essence of their function.   Gold just happens to be one of the more important 
commodities they monopolize and control.  
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The "governments" licensing central banks to engage in these illegal activities 
(commodity rigging is a crime and so is obstruction of trade) have been complicit and 
involved since the very first. The only real surprise is that the government doing the 
licensing isn't the actual government --- it's a commercial corporation in the business of 
providing essential government services.  

It's a vendor under contract to provide services to our government, so it doesn't actually 
have the authority to license the Federal Reserve or condone any other Central Bank, 
any commodity rigging or any obstruction of trade.   

We've had crooks licensing crooks for over a hundred years.  

For the British Crown franchise operating as "the United States of America, Inc." --- 
which has been impersonating our Federation of States, The United States of America 
(Unincorporated) to now pretend that it hasn't been the advocate, sponsor, and 
beneficiary of the Federal Reserve System is ludicrous.  The Federal Reserve has been 
its chief instrument of embezzlement, the means by which it issued the Federal Reserve 
Note, and used it to siphon unimaginable quantities of goods and services for no cost, 
and without the knowledge of the victims.  

They have promoted a system of fraud in which the poor have become increasingly poor 
and the rich have become increasingly rich --- unjustly.   

The Federal Reserve made its money on securitization schemes and seigniorage, the 
difference between the printing cost and the face value of the notes, which should have 
gone to the actual Principals, not private banks.  And, in the very distant future from the 
standpoint of 1913, the Plan was to cash in on the devaluation of the Federal Reserve 
Notes they were printing, and which were pegged against the United States Silver Dollar 
and gold which they were busy hoarding offshore.     

Cause the problem, offer the solution (or not), and profit from it.  

In this case, they have used cycles of inflation and deflation to systematically devalue 
whatever value the Federal Reserve Note ever had; because it is not actually a 
negotiable instrument it has no traditional value at all, but millions of deluded Americans 
have been forced under duress of "Legal Tender Laws" to exchange actual goods and 
services for this I.O.U. issued in the name of yet another foreign imposter, a Municipal 
Corporation calling itself "UNITED STATES OF AMERICA".   

We could not possibly make this up, yet it is all clearly stated, front and back, on every 
Federal Reserve Note issued.  

The ultimate payoff of the Plan was to run up the price of gold to staggering heights: ten 
thousand dollars per ounce, twenty thousand dollars per ounce --- and sell it back to the 
grandsons of the men they stole it from at grossly inflated prices.  
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They worked hard to obscure the amount of gold, until some members of Parliament, 
notably Lord Sassoon, were emboldened to make ridiculous public statements, like, 
"Everyone knows that no more than 15,000 tonnes of gold have been mined in the 
history of the world...."  

That would be news to Franklin Delano Roosevelt, who admitted collecting over 20,000 
tonnes of gold, merely by sending thugs in uniforms house to house and collecting 
wedding rings and watches belonging to honest people in America.  He got away with it 
by acting under color of law and in Gross Breach of Trust.   

We know what the Endgame of The Plan is --- run up the price of gold to the zenith, and 
then collect the final payoff planned in 1910.  

Buy gold at $28 an ounce, and sell it at, say, $17,000 an ounce several decades later.   

Banks and trusts, being incorporated entities, can afford to make plans that take 
hundreds of years to accomplish.  So they do so, and to the benefit of the bank and 
detriment of mankind.  The men who visited Jekyll Island and hatched the Federal 
Reserve Note knew what they were doing.   

They knew that all fiat currencies ever created in the history of the world are designed to 
be manipulated and used to extract the wealth of the nations issuing these instruments.  
They already knew that all fiat currencies eventually self-destruct. They couldn't know 
the exact time and place where this fate would come to the Federal Reserve Note, but 
they could plan for the eventuality and capture immense amounts of wealth in the 
meantime -- and they could hoard gold and manipulate gold markets to maximize gold 
prices when it did.  

This is precisely what you see going on right now, in front of our faces: maximizing gold 
prices in the face of fiat currency collapse, but they have failed to reach their "target" of 
$10,000 per ounce.  

Pause.  Why is that?   

Because other viable and unforeseen means of trade have been developed and entered 
the marketplace since 1910.  Developments like Bitcoin and Ethereum have taken a bite 
out of the control matrix necessary to propel gold prices into the stratosphere 
envisioned by the banking elite.  

Without those incredibly high gold prices, the bankers cannot meet the margin of activity 
-- the velocity of trading -- needed to avoid what they dread most: a monetary collapse.  
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A fiat collapse is one thing, unfortunate, but foreseen, like the death of a relative who 
has been sick and bed-ridden for forty years.  A monetary collapse is the one thing they 
could not expect and didn't plan for.  

The past two years have seen increasingly frantic efforts to find an answer to "double 
doomsday" scenarios, but no matter what they do, they can't save the fiat and they can't 
expand the gold market at a high enough price per ounce to meet "world market 
velocity" demand.  

The problem in simple terms is this:  Fiat currencies are highly elastic and can be 
controlled with relative ease, expanding and contracting with simple control valves, like 
taxes, to keep them on par with demand.   

Actual money is not elastic by comparison, and its value depends on supply of the 
commodity backing it, so if we were to supply the market with enough gold to meet the 
demand for a means of trade -- to say nothing of the demand for future borrowing 
capacity, it would become apparent that gold is not rare and not in short supply, but is 
finite.  And not really all that valuable as a commodity.  

The Federal Reserve, that is, The Plan, has shrugged its shoulders and basically said, 
we are in free fall now.  There's nothing we can do. The whole thing, both sides, are 
going to go "Splat!" --- so, just hang your heads, boys, go home, stockpile freeze-dried 
food....buy a gun, even if you don't know how to use it....and wait for the end.  

Imagine Central Bankers suddenly sounding like Preppers? And sitting in their 
Laz-E-Boy recliners, tears streaming down their faces, trying to figure a way out of this 
dilemma.   

They've tried "If you can't beat them, join them." with Central Bank Digital Currencies 
and "Stablecoin"-- but nobody believes in any of that.   

They've tried issuing asset-backed currencies, only to realize that all the gold, silver, 
platinum, land assets, and other commodities combined are not sufficient backing to 
float the boat they've built.  

It's like Noah's Ark without the Flood.   

They have, in Margaret Thatcher's famous frame of observation, "run out of everyone 
else's credit" -- paraphrased, and the economy they have "stimulated" into existence is 
too large for them to supply it even by using everyone else's physical assets to back new 
currencies like the "United States Note", which, ironically, is still a debt note.   
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This is because the physical Earth and the people living upon it are finite, but the Money 
Mill the platform traders and Wall Street wizards created is limited only by avarice and 
imagination. Thus you hear about "the Infinity Accounts"....clicking along on the opposite 
side of the ledger even faster than the National Debt clocks.  

What's a poor banker to do?  You can see the problem.  In order for their scheme to 
work and for them to profit, gold prices have to skyrocket to at least $10,000 per ounce, 
but if they release enough gold to meet trading demand, it will show everyone that gold 
isn't rare, and that will tank the price per ounce.   

China is dumping all the "notes" it held in reserve and all the U.S. Treasury Bonds it 
held, too.  Japan, in self-defense, is following suit.  

Even Saudi Arabia is getting in on the act.  This floods the market with "U.S. Debt" and 
spooks all the other potential buyers -- and holders of U.S. Debt-- who have profited 
from the debt-based Post WWII economy, and who are now joining a chorus of critics 
who say, "But America never pays its debts."  

Of course, it was never "America" responsible for this debt; it was always the "U.S." --- 
the so-called British Territorial United States and a commercial corporation calling itself 
"the United States of America"--- Incorporated, deliberately impersonating us.  Hello?  

This particular corporation is a vendor of government services, not a government.  
Certainly not our Government.  And everyone else, all the other governments knew 
what was going on, except for us. Our erstwhile employees were "assuming" our identity 
and accessing our credit like any credit card hacker does, while using us and our assets 
as the collateral to increase their credit limit and underwrite their bankruptcies.    

The banks were allowing this and U.S. Corporations like Vanguard and Black Rock were 
profiting themselves with wild glee, passing all their debts off and buying up our assets 
as pure profit-taking, because they bought into the British Crown's assurances that our 
actual Government didn't exist anymore, had been in "interregnum" for 160 years, and 
could be counted upon to remain silent in the face of their commercial claims against 
our physical assets.   

Here's an example of the Company Store Monopolies run amok:​
https://x.com/charise_lee/status/1950993353694388591 

Woe to the bankers and woe to the lawyers.  

The United States of America, Incorporated, never had the authority to license any 
central banks, and all their commercial banks are in infinite debt to us, which is why --- 
as their Priority and Preferential Creditors, we have moved to lawfully convert all these 
institutions and place them under new management.   
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The banks are responsible for this situation --- all the Central Banks, all the Maritime 
Commercial Banks and their shareholders and Principals --- have known the truth and 
yet ignored our Due Process and Notices since 1998; there can be no doubt concerning 
their abject liability, and the reason that we, the purported Public Trust Donors, have 
moved to recoup our assets and credit and have assigned both, respectively, to our own 
Global Family Banks.   

This is not a matter of politics or elections or proxy votes given to members of foreign 
corporations' "congresses".  This is about inheritance, identity, and substantive interest 
owed to millions of Americans first and foremost, and to the living people of many other 
nations who have been falsely indebted and misrepresented and harmed by the same 
corporate interests.  

Now Mr. Trump is attempting to invoke The Law of War and use "the United States 
Military" to make a clean sweep of his political adversaries, illegal immigrants, and 
corporate competitors; he is, so his press agents say, "declaring civil war".   

Mr. Trump has no agency competent to declare war of any kind, while operating as the 
CEO of a privately owned foreign corporation, and no access to the Law of War while 
the so-called "United States Military" is engaged as a commercial mercenary service.  

From our standpoint, this is just another criminal attempt to charge us for the "service" 
of destroying our people and our industries in the name of saving us.  Thank you, if you 
will but enforce the Law of Corporations, Mr. Trump, we can all be spared the disruption 
and expense of any "war" whatsoever.  

We are saying, clearly ---lawfully convert ("nationalize") all these banks and criminally 
mismanaged corporations, and save us the expense and drama of any more so-called 
war on our shores.  This is a criminal matter, not a political issue, and not a military 
issue, either.  

Insomuch as the United States Military is a commercial mercenary force that 
ultrreceives its daily bread from our largesse, we request Mr. Trump to deputize willing 
members of the United States Military to function as supra-delegated law enforcement 
officers, subject to our County Sheriffs and State Militia Commanders while operating 
within the States of the Union, all tasked to lawfully convert the Courts and other 
varieties of "United States" Corporations into property interests belonging to The United 
States, that is, our country, and subject to our Law, and placed under new management. 

By Declaration of Intent is hereby served as Notice --- all foreign corporations that have 
been operating unlawfully and in detriment to the Public and private interests of The 
United States and its People, as a result of established Gross Breach of Trust and 
criminal Violation of their Service Contracts and Operational Requirements --- are to be 
subsumed and nationalized throughout The United States and its Territories and 
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Possessions; all foreign subsidiaries of these corporations are to be similarly subsumed 
and nationalized for Cause effective midnight September 6th 2025.   

All monopoly interests including those surrounding the creation and use of Federal 
Reserve Notes as a Legal Tender and coercive transfer monopolies such as SWIFT 
System and resource monopolies of the kind described in the included video clip, are to 
be forthrightly liquidated, forfeited, or otherwise dissolved in favor of the American --not 
British Territorial-- Public Interest.  

As for "the Americans" never paying their debts, change that to "the British Territorials" 
never pay their debts and never intended to and throughout their history have been in 
debt; their use of semantic deceit and impersonation to fool the world and even many 
Americans into believing that "they were us" is all on them and their Principals -- the 
Pope, the British Monarch, the Lord Mayor of the Inner City of London, the Lords of the 
Admiralty, et alia.   

"The Americans" have been the victims of these con artists as much as everyone else, 
and have indeed paid their debts and even debts that were never their own, repeatedly, 
for six generations.  A simple observation and examination of what these crooks have 
done is sufficient to state the obvious:  

They have presented I.O.U.s and received actual goods and services in return; they 
have left the "spent" I.O.U.s in circulation, so that each I.O.U. has garnered repeated 
expenditure of actual goods and services far in excess of the recorded so-called 
"National Debt" established by the Issuers of the I.O.U.s.  The only cost or equitable 
consideration provided on their part is the cost of printing this "Legal Tender" --- which 
they more than recoup by receiving the Seigniorage on every such Note printed --- 
under False Pretenses, because they are not actually Principals and are not 
underwriting the debt.  Their failure to balance the books has created the False 
Appearance of a debt, which they have charged usury against.  These practices have 
created an imbalance in the world economy, in which apparently ever-increasing debt 
has not been counterbalanced by the also ever-increasing prepaid credit being 
accumulated by the living people exchanging actual goods and services for these paper 
promises issued by commercial corporations masquerading as actual governments.   

The international commercial courts and military authorities are being fully informed and 
enjoined to take appropriate action. To the best of our knowledge and belief, Donald 
Trump is occupying exactly the same offices occupied by "President" Abraham Lincoln 
and is operating in the same capacity as an Undeclared Agent of the British Crown; until 
such time as he demonstrates awareness of these realities and lawfully converts his 
own political status and operational capacity to fulfill the requirements of our actual 
presidential office, and appoints an appropriately loyal American Officer to act as 
Commander-in-Chief in his "absence", he is no President of ours.  

As for the monetary crisis caused by these crooks and their Hundred Year Plan, the only 
way to prevent a total meltdown of both credit and asset-backed money markets, is what 
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we have already suggested: (1) write off all Odious Debt; (2) make a reasonable 
calculation of the prepaid credit owed, admitting that it is at best only a logical estimate; 
(3) access the credit side of the ledger owed to the living people under our direction and 
use prepaid credit as a new means of Lawful Tender to support Land-based commerce 
engaged in by the nationalized corporations; (4) return the largesse to the lawful 
national governments and living people of all the nations.  

This allows all honest and harmless corporations to continue doing business in a safe 
and relatively deregulated environment with a minimum of debt, while returning control 
of our world to the actual asset owners and caretakers to whom all physical assets 
belong, and providing a reasonable and honest form of currency sufficient to support all 
known commercial activity with plenty of room for growth, and allowing the free trade 
and exchange of asset-based currencies that all our countries are owed.  

The only ones who lose out are predatory commercial corporations and the monsters 
who have so far misled our world into dystopian and murderous criminality: CIA 
implanted leeches profiting from private inventions and DARPA research like Bill Gates, 
Mark Zuckerberg, and Albert Bourla; politicians like GHWB, John McCain, Nancy Pelosi, 
and Gavin Newsom profiting themselves by embezzlement and payola and insider 
trading and "Black Ops"; disloyal Generals and Diplomats like Colin Powell, Norman 
Schwarzkopf, and Henry Kissinger; and the even lower scumbags like Jeffrey Epstein, 
who used gross sin as a means to blackmail anyone who could be compromised, or 
made to appear as if compromised, including high Church officials.   

The immediate nationalization of all maritime and territorial commercial corporations 
including those operating in and on the District of Columbia is a prerequisite to cleaning 
up this Mess and providing a peaceful transition in which there is a true minimum of 
blood-letting and chaos.  

Using the so-called United States Military as Deputies separately sworn provides the 
muscle needed to handle this situation appropriately--- and that is, as a crime.  To the 
extent that our military has been unknowingly converted into a mercenary service, they 
are afforded amnesty for past actions and inactions, but they must come home and do 
their actual duty and not provoke nor pretend a "civil war" on our shores.  

Mr. Trump's identity, office, and situation is what it is.  It's up to him to come home and 
man up, too.  If he fails to do so, he is just another CEO up to his underwear in 
commercial fraud and corporate self-interest.   

We've done more than everything reasonable to explain the situation and the history to 
Mr. Trump and his officers; their continued intransignant "representations" including their 
proposed use of individual Treasury Accounts and token gifts to American babies as a 
means to create a foreign interest debt and as an undisclosed means to latch onto their 
identities and estates, together with their proposal to substitute a British Territorial 
"Republic" for our American Federal Republic and pretend that they are restoring our 
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Republic instead -- is all indicative of more Bad Faith and more Filthy Hands in 
Commerce.  

All political status presumptions based on the receipt of gifts and benefits bearing 
undisclosed attachments as described herein, including but not limited to Social 
Security Accounts, Treasury Accounts, Licensed Privileges, and so on, plus all Legal 
Presumptions arising from undisclosed contracts signed by Birth Mothers and legally 
conflicted Medical Doctors are to be disallowed for fraud and self-interest.  

Please forward this information to all responsible authorities as a status report, criminal 
report, and Notice of Intent directly affirmed by our Lawful American Government and 
States of the Union.  Notice to Agents is Notice to Principals; Notice to Principals is 
Notice to Agents.  All court officers and officials including but not limited to operators of 
Municipal Tribunals and other Hired Jurists, are reminded of their responsibility to report 
crime, to eschew criminal activities, and to take all reasonable steps to prevent crime.   

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
Issued by:​ by Hunter Toyofuku-Aki© 
Anna Maria Riezinger© -- Fiduciary​ Visionary, Architect, Strategist, 
The United States of America​ Love-onomics© Founder 
In care of: Box 520994​ Treasury Director 
Big Lake, Alaska 99652 
 
August 1, 2025 
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